
                                                                                              
 
 
  ARLINGTON INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 

REGULAR MEETING OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
 Tuesday, December 12, 2023  
 5:00 p.m. 
 
NOTICE  of  

comply with the following registration procedures: Members of the public seeking to provide 
comments concerning an agenda item or non-agenda item shall be required to register at 

https://www.aisd.net/boardmeetingspeakerrequest NO LATER THAN 3:00 p.m. the day of the 
board meeting indicating (1) person’s name; (2) subject the member of the public wishes to 
discuss, and; (3) telephone number at which the member of the public may be reached. 

 
 

CALL TO ORDER: 5:00 p.m., Board Chamber 
 
 
CLOSED MEETING:  Board Conference Room  
  
Adjournment to closed meeting pursuant to Sections 551.071 (consultation with attorney to seek 
and receive legal advice); 551.072 (discuss the purchase, exchange, lease or value of real 
property); Section 551.073 – (negotiating contracts for prospective gifts or donations); Section 
551.074 - (consider the appointment, employment, evaluation, reassignment, duties, discipline, 
non-renewal or dismissal of a public officer or employee, or to hear complaints or charges against 
a public officer or employee); Section 551.076 (consider the deployment, or specific occasions 
for implementation, of security personnel and devices); Section 551.082 – (discussing or 
deliberating the discipline of a public school child or children, or a complaint or charge is brought 
against an employee of the school district by another employee); Section 551.0821 – (deliberating 
in a matter regarding a public school student if personally identifiable information about the 
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OPEN FORUM FOR AGENDA ITEMS: 
 
Must Pre-Register.  Registration as stated above must be completed in its entirety and submitted 
no later than 3:00 p.m.  This first Open Forum is limited to agenda items other than personnel.  
Any personnel concern should be brought directly to the Superintendent or Board President prior 
to the meeting, who will guide you to the proper procedure pursuant to Board Policy.  Speakers 
will be limited to three (3) minutes.  When more than one individual wishes to address the same 
agenda item, the President may ask the group to appoint one spokesperson. 
 
 
ACTION: 
 
A. Approve Superintendent Authorization to Hire Chief Internal Auditor 

 
B. Superintendent Search/Select Lone Finalist 
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Section 551.072 - For the purpose of discussing the purchase, exchange, lease or value of real 
property. 
 
Section 551.073 - For the purpose of negotiating contracts for prospective gifts or donations. 
 
Section 551.074 - For the purpose of considering the appointment, employment, evaluation, 
reassignment, duties, discipline or dismissal of a public officer or employee or to hear complaints 
or charges against a public officer or employee. 
 
Section 551.076 - To consider the deployment, or specific occasions for implementation, of 
security personnel and devices. 
 
Section 551.082 - For the purpose of deliberating in a case involving discipline of a public school 
child or children, or in a case in which a complaint or charge is brought against an employee of 
the school district by another employee and the complaint or charge directly results in a need for 
a hearing.  
 
Section 551.0821 - For the purpose of deliberating in a matter regarding a public school student 
if personally identifiable information about the student will necessarily be revealed by the 
deliberation.   
 
Section 551.083 - For the purpose of considering the standards, guidelines, terms or conditions 
the Board will follow, or instruct its representatives to follow, in consultation with representatives 




